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ACROBAT CHARDONNAY
OREGON
Acrobat wines are the result of determination to handcraft Oregon Pinot
Noir and Pinot Gris of the highest quality. At the heart of these wines 
is the love of pairing an honest wine with casual meals and gatherings. 
Acrobat should always be an effortless selection—a wine that consistenly 
pairs in every way with our lives. Acrobat is artfully crafted in the 
gorgeous hills and valleys of western Oregon, with an eye on sustainable 
winemaking practices. 

TASTING NOTES
Fields of exuberant yellow straw come to mind when describing this 
chardonnay’s color. On the nose, a bouquet of notes ranging from ripe 
peach and pear, to bright lemon and vanilla, shine through. A clean 
and refined entrance gives way to layers of lemon zest, pear and creamy 
vanilla on the mid-palate. The medium-long finish is fresh and held 
together by lively acidity.

WINEMAKING PROCESS
The 2021 vintage was 100% aged in French oak barrels and completed 
malolactic fermentation. This wine was inoculated with a Burgundian 
isolate of yeast to enhance the mouthfeel and preserve the beautiful 
aromatics.

VINTAGE NOTES
The 2021 growing season will be remembered in Oregon for record 
setting heat and dry conditions across the region. The Chardonnay for 
the 2021 vintage was sourced from the Naumes Vineyard in the Rogue 
Valley and the Blue Heron and Carlow Vineyards in Umpqua Valley. 
These regions had one of its earliest harvests on record in early and late 
September. Fruit with high sugars, low disease pressure, and lower than 
average yields made for concentrated wines with ripe and fruity aromatics. 

Varietal: 100% Chardonnay	   AVA: Oregon	 Alcohol: 13.5%


